JULY 17, 2024

THE FOLLOWING BID PROPQOSALS FOR FITTINGS, REPAIR PARTS, SERVICE EQUIPMENT AND TOOLS FOR
THE LAKE COUNTY UTILITIES DEPARTMENT WERE RECEIVED BY THE BOARD OF LAKE COUNTY
COMMISSIONERS ON WEDNESDAY, JULY 17, 2024, AT 11:00 AM:

PROPOSAL

CORE AND MAIN

SEE ATTACHMENTS INFORMAL BID AMOUNTS
BID BOND YES

PROPOSAL

WINWATER CF AKRON

SEE ATTACHMENTS INFORMAL BID AMOUNTS
BID BOND YES



SPECIFICATIONS
FOR FITTINGS, REPAIR PARTS, SERVICE EQUIPMENT AND TOOLS

FITTINGS, REPAIR PARTS, SERVICE EQUIPMENT AND TOOLS TO BE PURCHASED

Lake County Sewer and Water District expects to purchase the following quantities of fittings, repair parts, service
equipment and tools on an as needed basis, THE BIDDER WITH THE LOWEST TOTAL ON GROUPED ITEMS
WILL RECEIVE THE BID FOR THAT ENTIRE GROUP. Quantitles are the estimated annual amounts mere oy
less we expect to purchase, Minlmum orders can be four (4) of any size or combination thereof, The width shall not
be less than that called for in the schedule of items. Each repair part shall be marked with nominal pipe size, tap
size and type of pipe. Al fittings and repair parts must be In compliance with the "Reduction of Lead In Drinking
Water Act” all brass products must meet the "Lead Free" standards as defined under Public Law 111-380,

PIPE REPAIR CLAMPS  *AS LISTED OR APPROVED EQUAL UNIT PRICE
OD RANGE 4.74-5.14 + OD 4.95-5.35 _ 4.57-5.14 _ 4.955.35
1A 4"x7.5" *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MOREOR LESS  122.50 124.40
. . i
26 4"X7.5"X1"CC  *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MOREOR LESS  134.40 146.90 s
Q
A 4"X 15" *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE® 10 MORE OR LESS ~ 233.10 248.70 &
4A_ 4"X15"X1"CC ~ *SMITHBLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MOREORLESS  oga o 570 60
OD RANGE 6.84- 7.24
lsa g x7.5 *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 20 MORE OR LESS 140.90
BA  6"X7.5"X1"CC  *SMITHBLAIR 256 STYLE 20 MORE OR LESS 144.50 -
o,
17a E" X 15* *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 20 MORE OR LESS 281.75 §
[]
8A  6"X15"X1YCC  *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 20 MORE OR LESS 310.10
9A  6"X22.5" *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 20 MORE OR LESS 449 99
OD RANGE 8.99- 6.39
160.15
10A  B"X7.5" ¥SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 20 MORE OR LESS
11A  @"X75"X1"CC  *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 20 MORE OR LESS 181.80 "
(=8
" n % 32025 3
124 8"X15 SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 20 MORE OR LESS =
5]
134 8"X15"X 1" CC  *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 20 MORE OR LESS 331.70
144 8" X22.5" *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 20 MORE OR LESS 527.00
' OD RANGE 11.04 - 11,44 _
_ ' 203.70
15A  10"X7.5" *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS
o 209.25
{16A  1D"X7.5"X 1"CC *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MOREOR LESS -
[«
. =
174 10" X 15" *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 407.40 2
U]
184 10"X15"X 1"CC  *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 463.15
19a 10" X 22.5" *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 632.45
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PIPE REPAIR CLAMPS *AS LISTED OR APPROVED EQUAL UNIT PRICE

OD RANGE 13.10 - 13.50
04 12°X 7.5 *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 229.05
214 12"X 7.5" X 1" CC *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 244.75 o
2A 12'X 15° *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 458.15 3
334 12X 15" X1"CC *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 481.70 ?
24A 12X 22.5" *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 709.50
PIPE REPATR CLAMPS FOR AC PIPE AS LISTED OR APPROVED EQUAL UNIT PRICE

OD RANGE 7.05 - 7.45
A 6" X 75 *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 150.00
26A 6" X 7.5" X-1" CC *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 171.05 o
A B X 15 “*SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 300.00 g
28A 6 X15"X1"CC *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 322.80 ?
254 6" x22.5" #SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 478.40
308 6" X 22.5"X 1" CC *SMITH ELAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 498 75,
OD RANGE 9.27 - 9.67

34 8"X75" *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 163.20
JA 8'X 75 X 1" CC *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 189.15 ~
BA 8" X 15 *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 326.35 %
34A 8" X 15" X 1" CC #SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 351.90 “
354 B"x 225" *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE  10.MORE OR LESS 241.25
368 8" x 22.5" X 1" €C #*SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS EGg 45

OD RANGE 11.04 - 12,24 11.34-11757 11.75-12.15 T11.6012.40
378 10X 75" X 17 CC *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MOREOR Less 22020 330.80 314.99
384 107X 157 *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MOREORLEss _ 409.55 41830 84305 |a
394 10" X 15°X 1".CC *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MOREORLEss 221-18. 419.85 708.70 %
40A 10"x 22.5" *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MOREOQRLESs 795.90 680.85 957.10
414 10"x22.5" X 1° CC XSMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MOREORLFSS g4pgs 03.25 1076.90

OD RANGE 14.00 - 14.40
428 12"X75"X1"CC *SMITH BLAIR- 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 391.10
434 12°X 15" *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 474.35 g
448 12'X 15" X 1" CC *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 501.05 %
458 12" x 2.5 *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 735.80 '
46A 12" x 22.5'X1"€C  *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS 768.05
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PIPE REPAIR COUPLINGS

*AS LISTED OR AFFROVED EGUAL

18 FSMITH-BLAIR 441
COUPLINGS W/ 5.8 99.85
NUTS & BOLTS 20 MORE OR LESS
2B 6" *SMITH-BLAIR 441
COUPLINGS W/ 5.5 118.80
NUTS & BOLTS 50 MORE OR LESS ' o
38 g *SMITH-BLAIR 441 ) =
COUPLINGS W/ 5.5 221.65 =
NUTS & BOLTS 30 MORE OR LESS 2
4B 10" *SMITH-BLAIR 441 @
COUPLINGS W/ S.5 207.75
NUTS 8 BOLTS 10 MORE OR LESS
58 i *SMITH-BLAIR 441
COUPLINGS W/ 5.5 283.35
NUTS & BOLTS 15 MORE OR LESS
M,J. TEE BOLTS WITH NUT 304 OR 316
1C 34" X 4 STAINLESS STEEL 500 MORE OR LESS 7.20
IC 34" X412 STAINLESS STEEL 500 MORE OR LESS 7.75 by
=
o 10.25 e
3C  3/4"X 4" ANTI-ROTATING STAINLESS STEEL 500 MORE OR LESS @
3/4" x4-1/2" ANTI- 10.50
4C  ROTATING .STAINLESS STEEL 500 MORE OR LESS e
VALVE BOXES *AS LISTED OR APPROVED EQUAL USIT PRICE
10 Cs1/a" HEAVY DUTY VALVE
BOX W/ SLOTTED
LID COMRLETE 30 MORE OR LESS 205.00
D # NGN TRAFFIC VALVE 180.00
BOX COMPLETE 30 MORE OR LESS
3D C 514" 16" TOP SECTION
HDVB6301-16 W/ 85.00 o
SLOTTED LID 30 MORE OR LESS &
4n  C5-1/4" 26" TOP SECTION _ 2
HDVB6301-26 W/ 94.00 o
SLOTTED LID 30 MORE OR LESS
5D 12" THRU 16 '
VALVE BOX BOTTOM 45.00
SECTION FOR 5-1/4” 30 MORE CR LESS
60 24" THRU 36" VALVE BOX BQTTOM 63.00
SECTION FOR 5-
174" 30 MORE COR LESS
7D C51/4" SLOTTED VALVE . 21.00
BOX LIDS 30 MORE OR LESS 0
#6 VALVE BOX by
B #e BASE/BONETT FOR'S 75.00 &
14" 30 MORE OR LESS
ROUND VALVE BOX RISERS FOR C 5-1/4" VALVE BOXES
iE 1" FOR C 5-1/4" VALVE 2200
BOXES 30 MORE OR LESS
2E 2 FOR C 5-1/4" VALVE 33.00
BOXES 30 MORE DR LESS
E 3 FOR C 5-1/4" VALVE 44 00 s
BOXES 30 MORE DR LESS : 2
sE 4 ;g;E Cs 5-1/4" VALVE 50.00 %
30 MORE OR LESS
5 50 FOR C 5-1/4" VALVE
BOXES 30 MORE OR LESS 67.00
6E & FOR C 5-1/4" VALVE
BOXES 30 MORE OR LESS 67.00
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CURB BOXES

AS LISTED OR APPROVED EQUAL

CURB STOP BOX
¥ COMPLETE 94E 30 MORE OR LESS 83.00 "
2F 16" EXTENSION FOR 94E CURB STOP &
BOX 20 MORE OR LESS 27.00 3
3F  TOPSECTION FOR 94E CURB STOP _ &
BOX 30 MORE OR LESS 43.00
4F  TOP SECTION 101 CLEVELAND
30 MORE OR LESS 51.00
5F  CURB STOP BOX LID W/ _
BOLT FOR 94E CURB'BOX 30 MORE OR LESS 14.00 °
6F  REPAIR LID 2-1/2" INNER- =
36701GE FOR 94E CURB BOX 30 MORE OR LESS 29.50 §
7F  REPAIR LID 2-1/2" _ &
[ _OUTER FOR 94E CURB BOX 30 MORE OR LESS 29.50
100% BRONZE MUELLER SERVICE SADDLES ONLY
16 4"X1"CC MUELLER BR2B 20 MORE OR LESS 189.00
G E"X1'CC MUELLER BR2B 20 MORE OR LESS 222.00 N
G g X1"CC MUELLER BR2B 20 MORE OR LESS 275.00 5
46 10"X1'CC MUELLER BR2B 20 MORE OR LESS 340.00 &
CORPORATION STOPS AS LISTED OR APPROVED EQUAL UNIT PRICE
1H 34" FLARE OUTLET H-15000 SERIES 50 MORE OR LESS 34.09
@
2H 1" FLARE OUTLET H-15000 SERIES 50 MORE OR LESS 52.08 a
34 1-1/2*FLAREOUTLET ~ B-25000 SERIES 10 MORE OR LESS 159.77 2
4H 2" FLARE OUTLET 8-25000 SERIES 10 MORE OR. LESS 279.12.
SH 1" M X 3/4" FM BRASS
BUSHING BBAA-43 75 MORE OR LESS 14.13
GH  2"M X1 1/2" FM BRASS &
BUSHING BBAA-76 10 MORE OR LESS 46.53 g
7H
1" X 3/4" PIGGY BACK NUT COZ-43 50 MORE OR LESS 22.39
i 34" '
C22-33 100 MORE OR LESS 18.89 S
a1 a
C22-44 50 MORE OR LESS 33.04 3
31 38X Y
C22-34 10 MORE DR LESS 27.95
a2 .
H-15400 10 MORE OR LESS 99.21 a
51 o 2
2277 10 MORE OR LESS 161.85 &
CURB STOPS FLARE TO FLARE AS LISTED OR APPROVED EQUAL
13 3/4" 75.20 |
B22-333 50 MORE QR LESS a
2] 1I| g
B22-444 25 MORE OR. LESS 103.87 o
31 1y 25227 e}
B22-666 10 MORE OR LESS a
43 2 412.95 2
B22-77 L 10 MORE OR LESS _ 2

C
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SERVICE INSTALLATION PARTS

AS LISTED OR APPROVED EQUAL

1K 3%“ ANGLE YOKE VALVE 36.67
AV-92-323 50 MORE OR LESS +
2K %" EPOXY COATED YOKE 14.09 Py
Y-502 50 MORE OR LESS 3
3K %" ANGLE YOKE ELLS 15.56 o
L-92-233 50 MORE OR LESS
4K 1" ANGLE YOKE VALVE 54.46
AV-92-444 50 MORE OR LESS: i
5K 1" EPOXY COATED YOKE 25 .40 A
Y-504 50 MORE OR LESS g
6K 1" ANGLE YOKE ELLS 97.20 L)
L-92-444 50 MORE OR LESS
7K 1-1/2" FLANGE X FLARE 206.03 o
ANGLE VALVE FV23-666W 10 MORE OR LESS . &
8K 1-1/2" FLANGE X FLARE T27.40 8
ANGLE ELL LF32-66 10 MORE OR LESS 2
9K  3/4" EXPANSION ~
CONNECTOR EC-23 100 MORE OR LESS 22.46 N
10K 1" EXPANSION CONNECTOR 37.75 g
EC-4 100 MORE OR LESS <
11K 5/8" X 3/4° X 2-1/2" METER 10.92
CONNECTOR C-38-23-2-5 200 MORE OR LESS a9
12K 5/8" X.3/4" X 2 METER _ 10.92 &
CONNECTOR C-38-23-2 200 MORE OR LESS g
13K 17X 2.625" METER 16.80 e
CONNECTOR C-38-44-2-625 100 MORE OR LESS
14K 2” METER FLANGE X FIP _ ==
AY-7610F 100 MORE OR LESS 63.41 5 o
15K METER BOX COVER & LID 3742
C-32-T 100 MORE OR LESS
16K METER BOX LID ONLY 4230 =
C3L-T 11.5 50 MORE OR LESS 2
17K 18" X 24" EXPANSION RING 111.70 2
FORD #1 75 MORE OR LESS ) v
18K METER VAULT ELEVATOR | 1057
RING 3" ER3CX-C14512-001 50 MORE OR LESS ’
19K 18" X 30" PVCMETER _ No Bid =
VAULT 75 MORE OR LESS a
20K 24" X 30" PVC METER No Bid' 2
VAULT 75 MORE OR LESS @
TCOLS _
1L 3/4" MUELLER DRILL & TAP - e 284.00
o THREAD #680539 12 MORE OR LESS
7L 1" MUELLER DRILL & TAP 377.00 P
CC THREAD #680540 6 MORE OR LESS g
Al 1-1/2" DRILL & TAP 916.00 o
#£631488 & MORE OR LESS =
4L 2" DRILL & TAP 1,286.00
#681483 6 MORE OR LESS
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MUELLER GATE VALVES ALL OL ALL 304 OR 316 5§ _
1M 4° MUELLER GATE VALVE
A2360 12 MORE OR LESS 792.00
2M 4" MUELLER OVERSIZED 1.473.00 -
VALVE ONLY 05-040C236042LN 12 MORE OR LESS , . g
3M 6" MUELLER _ S
A2360 12 MORE OR LESS 1,010.00 &
4M 8" MUELLER .
A2360 12 MORE OR LESS 1,609.00
MARKING PAINT AS LISTED OR APPROVED EQUAL
1IN KRYLON INDUSTRAIL _
QUICK MARK APWA WATER- 100 CASES MORE OR 5.05 -
BASED _ WHITE #A03901 LESS e
2N KRYLON INDUSTRAIL 3
QUICK MARK APWA WATER 100 CASES MORE OR 5.05 G
BASED BLUE #A03903 LESS
PVCO PIPE AS LISTED OR. APPROVED EQUAL
10 6" PVCO PIPE M EAGLE  OR
APSROVED EQUAL  80' MORE OR LESS 16.35
20 &' PVCO PIPE M EAGLE OR _ .
APPROVED EQUAL  100' MORE OR LESS 28.05 Y
30 10" PVCO PIPE M EAGLE OR 3
APPROVED EQUAL  20' MORE OR LESS 4215 ]

40 12"PVCO PIPE

M EAGLE OR _
APPROVED EQUAL  40' MORE OR LESS 99.35

1€




HYDRANT COLLISION REPAIR KIT

1P MUELLER5-1/4"  A-423 12 MORE OR LESS 369.00
2P KENNEDY 5-1/4° K108 12 MORE OR LESS _No Bid @
3P KENNEDY 5-1/4" K11 12 MORE OR LESS No Bid %
4P KENNEDY 5-1/4" K81 12 MORE OR LESS 358.00 -
5P AMDARLING 5-1/4” B62 12 MORE OR LESS 405.00
F:glg'r_??i%s M3 NST **MUELLER ONLY**
e g‘: MI SHOE 423-538352 20 MORE OR LESS 3,865.00 N
2 g 1-/;i -6" MISHOE  423-538353 20 MORE OR LESS 3,955.00 %‘
3Q 66" ;4?;{';:3'& 423-538354 20 MORE OR LESS 4,045.00 ®
_FIRE HYDRANTS SPIN IN MST **MUELLER ONLY**
[ag 5 - 14 M
49 6.25 0D, g 466-538348 15 MORE OR LESS 4,461.00
- :Eg ;;D’?‘igl e 466-538349 15 MORE OR LESS. 4,577.00
" g-.z_sch)gf aPL 46538350 15 MORE OR LESS 4,693.00
A g.';g O“D?;{":I — 15 MORE OR LESS 4,887.00 o
" g.t;?g-g;, M s 15 MORE OR LESS 5,985.00 %
9Q  6'-6"- 5-1/4° MVO P 2
8.875 OD, 4TI 467-538359 15 MORE OR LESS 330
o ;2-;61]3/'4 411?‘0 468-538360 15 MORE OR LESS 4,584.00
10 :ég E).g:ﬁplmvo 468-538361 15 MORE OR LESS 4,703.00
2Q _2,215553’, 4Tn;:3\110 468~538362 15 MORE OR LESS 4,823.00
STORZ ADAPTER |
IR 5" STORZ ADAPTER NSy X 5 SToR 360.00 g @

NST X 5" STORZ

75 MORE OR LESS
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_ake County Sewer and Water District expecis to purchase the following auantities of fittings,

SPECIFICATIONS

W P
FlAR Ll iy, REPALR

PARTE, SERVICE EGUIPM

ENT AND

TOOGLES

FITTINGS, REPAIR PARTS, SERVICE EQUIPMENT AND TOOLS T BE PURCHASED

repair parts, sarvics

2quipment and tools on an as needed basis, THE BIDDER WITH THE LOWEST TOTAL OM SROUPED ITEMS

WEL)L RECEIVE THE BID

FOR THAT ENTIRE GROUP. Quantities are the estimated annual amounts more or

ress we expect to purchase. Minimum orders can be faur (4) of any size or combination therzof. The width shall ok
be tess than that called for in the schedule of itemns. Each repair part shall be marked with nominal pipe size, tap
size and type of pipe. All fittings and repalr paris must be in compliance with the "Reduction of Lead in Drinking
Water Act" all brass products must meet the "Lead Free" standards as defined under Public Law 111-380.

PIPE REPAIR CLAMPS AS LISTED OR APPROVED EQUAL _UNIT PRICE
L OD RANGE 4.74-5.14 + OD 4.95-5.35 - )
A w7 #SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS _$122.28 s ]
24 "X 75'X1"CC FSMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS $134.11ea B g
A 4 X1 *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS $232.63 ea_ L%
“SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LEss  $253.35ea
T obRANGERSETAA
*SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 20 MORE OR LESS $1 QIQ_QELB‘@M@“ -]
*SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 20 MOKE OR LESS _$144.18 ea e
HBLAIR 256 STYLE  20MOREORLEss  $281.19ea | 5 |
*SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 20 MORE OR LESS $309.47 ea N

*SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE

20 MORE CR LESS

_OD RAMGE 8.99- 9.39

BE X758 K1

8" ¥ 15"

SI? X 13!] }{ l" CC

FSMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 20 MORE OR LESS $1 59.83 ea
FSMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 20 MORE OR LESS $181.42 ea i
“SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 20 MORE OR LESS $319.62 ea i §
*SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 20 MORE OR LESS $331.03 ea 7
“SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE MORE OR LESS3 ~ $525.94 ea

0D RANGE 11.04 - 11.44

67 X 75" TSMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE

10" X75"X I"CC *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE

10 MORE OR LESS

10 MORE OR LESS

10 MORE OR LESS

16 MORE OR LESS

10 X 15" ¥SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE
10X 15"X 1" CC *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE
107 % 23.5¢ “SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE

WINWATER

i

$203.30 ea

$208.82 ea

$406.60 ea o
B $462.20 ea

A0 MOREORLESS

GROUP 4




_FAE LISTED OR APPROVED EQUAL

A , ODPRANGE310-1350 B
1208 12" X 7.5" *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS $228.59 ea ]

HA 1R IER e SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS $244.23 ea

224 12" X 15" . *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS $457.19 ea

GROUP &

234 12"X 15" X 1" CC “SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS $480.72 ea

24A 12" 225" *SMITHBLAIR 256 STYLE 1oMomeortess  $708.03 ea

en e ﬂ)w i it s

PIPE REPAIR CLAMPS FOR AC PIPE AS LISTED OR APPROVEDEQUAL L uMiTemice
" OD RANGE 7.05 - 7.45 ]

e i e e e e e e

254 6" X 7.5" “SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10MOREORLESS  $149.67 ea

T A . LRt P S e AN 23 e RS i

26A 6"X7.5"X 1" CC “SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS _$170.68ea ©
NN 5. £ .- L= . s ©

274 6'X 15" “SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10MOREORLESS _ $299.3%9ea S
i £

{284 6"X 15" 1" CC *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS HH@2217 ea_ ... .

ST

29A 5"x 225" *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS _$477.40ea |

R

e

“SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORECRLESS $497.24 ea
T 0D RANGE 9.27 - 8.67

1A 8"X75" "SMITHBLAIR 256 STYLE 10MOREORLEss  $162.85ea

1324 "X 757X 1"CC “SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MOREORLESs  $188.75 ea

1338 8"X15° *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS $325 67 ea g |
i i i b s e LT I . C"}

1344 8" X 15" X 1" CC *GMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORF OR LESS $3511688

:35;1 8" x 22.5" *GMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS %555;401168

22,

__“SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS
' ' OD RANGE 11.04 - 12,24

ik

1374 10"X 7.5" X 1" CC “SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS $298 49 ea

38 10" 15" “SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS h§412ﬁ5 = T

GROUP 8

39 K 15" X 1 OO *SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MOREORLESS $42437ea

404 10" x 22,57 FSMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS $801 .96 ea.

B T

414 10"x32.8"X1"CC  YSMITHBIAIR 256 STYLE 10MOREORLESS  $817. 12 ea
OD RANGE 14.90 - 14.40 '

ea
434 12X 15" “SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE OR LESS _$473.34 ea

424 12"X7.5" X 1" CC “SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MOREORLESS $39

GROUP 9

448 12"X 15" K 1" CC “SMITH BLAIR 256 STE 10 MOREORLESS _ $500.03 ea

454 12X 25" "SMITH BLAIR 256 STYLE 10 MORE GRLESS wﬂ$734____3__’! _@g -

don X xZ22FXECC  USMITHBLAIR 256 STYLE 1OMOREORIEss ~~~ $766.50ea |

o g by

WINWATER



l'.‘ Ve LISTRED R AP
FSMITH-BLAIR 4417
COUPLINGS W/ S.S
NUTS & BOLTS
*SMITH-BLAIR 441
COUPLINGS W/ 5.5
NUTS & BOLTS
ESMITH-BLAIR 441
COUPLINGS W/ S.5
MUTS & BOLTS
#*SMITH-BLAIR 441
COUPLINGS W/ S.5
NUTS & BOLTS
ESMITH-BLAIR 441
COUPLINGS W/ S.5
- MUTS & BOLTS

20 MORE OR LESS

50 MORE OR LESS

30 MORE OR LESS

10 MORE OR LESS

15 MORE OR LESS

_$9981ea
92217068 ]
$19592ea |

.4, TEL" 805. T3 %‘r"{‘ﬂ' MUT 304 OR 316

1C 374" 4" STAINLESS STEEL

2C 34T 4.2 STAIMLESS STEEL

3¢ 34X 4" ANTI-ROTATING  STAINLFESS STEFL
34" « 4-1)2" ANTI-

ROTATING

STAINLESS STEEL

S00 MOREORLESS —  pO.20 |

500 MOREOR LESS

500 MORE OR LESS

500 MORE OR. LESS

ASLIE

ED OR APPROVED EQUAL

csia HEAYY DUTY VALVE
BOX W/ SLOTTED
LID COMPLETE
#22
NOMN TRAFFIC VALVE
__BOX COMPLETE
 TOP SECTIO;
HDYB8301-16 ¥/
SLOTTED LID
4D €51/ TOP SECTION
: HDYB6301-26 W/
SLOTTED LID

hl

I'\J
[_T\

5D 12" THRU 18°
VALVE BOY BOTTOM
SECTION FOR 5-1/4”
VALVE BOX BOTTOM
SECTION FOR 5-
1/4*

30 MORE OR

LESS

30 MORE OR LESS

RHOCERRIESS

30 MORE GR LESS

30 MORE OR LESS R

TGRS VALVE
BOX LIDS

VALVE BOX
BASE/BONETT FOR S
174"

30 MORE OR LESS

MORE OR LESS

SOMOREORLESS e

_$283.51ea

_$22.00ea _
] §23.0Qea

_$185.00ea
$14850ea

~ $49.50 ea

.$57.00ea _ ]

51510 ea_

SFORC 5-1/4"

JALVE BOXES

FOR C5-1/4" VALVE
BOXES

FOR C 5-1/4" VALVE
BOXES

FOR C 5-1/4" VALVE
BOXES

FOR C 5-1/4" VALVE
BOXES

FOR C 5-1/4™ VALVE
DOVD.'C

FOR C 5-1/4"

[TV

WINWATER

YALVE

30 MORE OR LESS

30MOREOR LESS

30 MORE OR LESS

30 MORE OR LESS

30 MORE OR LESS

13
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~ $66. OD ea__._...|

L A AL A oS

.. $4500ea

GROUP 10

GROUP 14

GROUP 1

Rl Bt e A




i o BUXLES ) SO AT
I rOMPLETE 94E 30 MORE OR LESS $§ ‘1 JQ‘O @g I
2F 16" EXTENSION FOR 94E CURB STOP N N
BOX 20 MORE OR LESS $26.75ea 13
I3F  TOP SECTION FOR 94E CURR STOP e
BOX 30 MORE OR LESS . $§ 1.00ea
M4F  rOP SECTION 101 CLEVELAND
b n_m_JBQMOR OR LESS _$40.00ea |
5F  CURB STOP BOX 'L{D W - R T
i BOLT FOR 94E CURB BOX 30 MORE OR LESS $51 709 ea 1.
gsF REPA(R LID 2-1/2" INNER- é
] 36701GF FOR. 94E CURB BOX 30 MORE OR LESS __$36.00ea | 3
{7F  REPAIR LID 2-1/2" 18
OUTER FOR 94E CURB BOX__ 30 MORE OR LESS $36.00ea |
100% BRONZE MUELLER SERVICE SADDLES ONLY _’_ - '_‘ ) o T
16 4"X1"CC MUELLER BR2B 20 MORE OR LESS NO BID B
6 6"X1°CC MUELLER BR2B 0 MORE OR LESS ~
3G 8"X1"CC MUELLER BR22 20 MORE OR LESS %
~ [TRRY 1] 3 2l (g
4G 10"X1°CC MUELLER BR2B 20 MORE OR LESS =

15G 12"XitcC MUELLER BRZR

20 MORE OR LESS

',m PORATION STOPS  AS LISTED DR APPROVED EQUAL ) : T
n 3/4" FLARE OUTLET H-15000 SERTES SO MORE OR LESS $35 49 ea AY ]
e LARE OUTLET H-15000 SERIES 50 MORE OR LESS _$53.53ea AY 5
g
34 1-1/2" FLARE OUTLET B-25000 SERIES 10 MORE OR LES5 $1 64.45 ea A AY R
444 2" FLARE OUTLET B-25000 SERIES 10 MORE OR LESS H__W?__$287*;OO ea AY
s e o R
| BUSHING BEAA3 75 MORE OR LESS _$15.21ea AY
BH  2"M X1 172" FM BRASS ' - N A
BUSHING BBAA-76 10 MORE OR LESS _$50.00 ea AY g
7
. 1’;;_3/'*" PIGGYBACKMUT 0743  SOMOKEORLESS  $24 10 ea AY _
€22-33 1omoreortess  $20.32ea AY 1o
a1 e
C22-44 50 MORE OR LESS _$35.50ea AY 13
C2234 10 MORE OR LESS $30 Q0ea AY 1
H-15400 10 MORE OR LESS $1 0_2 00 ea AY  ia
51 2 B
- 2L I0MOREORIESS — $166.50 ea AY 19
CURB STOPS FLA LARE A5 LISTED OR APPROVED EQUAL o N
1 3 R
£22-333 50 MORE OR LESS $79 85ea AY iz
- S 9
o B2pesd 25 MORE OR. LESS $1 10. 55 ea AY 1a
B22-686 10 MORE OR LESS 8258, OO_ea AY o 1a
4y o g
I B2 MOMOREcRiEss  $42500ea AY 10|

WINWATER




IGLE YOKE VALVE

11K
AV-92-323

K %" EPOXY COATED YOKE
¥-502
3K

2" ANGLE YOKE ELLS

1-92-233

lrzncam m e o

50 MORE OR LESS

50 MORE CR LESS

7 $16 50ea AY

$1 395 ea AY -

50 MORE OR LESS

T {7 ANGLE YORE VALVE
AV-92-444
SK 1" EPOXY COATED YOKE
Y-504
1" ANGLE YOKE ELLS
L-92-444

50 MORE OR LESS

$597568AY

$29 OO ea AY

T Y S e it o S S EAR R

50MOREORLESS __ $24.00 ea AY

GROUP 25

1 1]2” FLANGE X FLARE
AMGLE VALVE

1-1/2" FLANGE X FLARE
ANGLE ELL

FV23-666W
3K

50 MORE OR LESS

10 MOREOR LESS

erm————

_NOBID _

e o e

NO BID

LF32-66

10 MORE OR LESS

9K 3j4" EXPANSION
CONMECTOR

1" EXPANSION CONMECTOR

EC-23
10K
EC-4

100 MORE OR LESS

100 MORE OR LESS _

.

I

i GROUP 26

i

_$24.00 ea AY _

$40 OO ea AY

i GRQUP 27

11K 5/2" X 3/4" X 2-1/2" METER
COMMECTOR
5/8" X 3/4" ¥ 2" METER
COMNECTOR
1" % 2.825"
__CONNECTOR

C-33-23-3-5

12K

C-38-23-2
METER

200 MORE OR LESS N

200 MORE OR LESS

$12.00ea AY
_$12.00ea AY |

|
i
asell

100 MORE OR LESS

“T27METER FLANGE X FIP

16k

METER BOX LID CNLY

C3L-T 115"

171 18" ¥ 24" EXPANSION RIMG
FORD #1
18K METER VAULT ELEVATOR

RING

ER3CX-C14512-001

100 MORE OR LESS _
50 MORE OR LESS

75 MORE CR LESS

50 MORE OR LESS

18" X 30" PVC METER
VAULT

24" X 30" PVC METER
VAULT

120K

e e A B A 2 S B T A

M CRE DR LEBS e

75 MORE OR LESS

_$1845ea AY

_$42.00ea AY

.54450ea AY

_$42.00ea AY

$24.50 ea AY

$70.00 ea AY

GRGUP 30

1L 3/ 4" MUELLER DRILL &
CC THREAD

1" MUELLER DRILL & TAP
CC THREAD

1-1/2" DRILL & TAP

TP
2 #680539

#680540

#681488
2" DRILL & TAF
#081“%:9

WINWATER

12 MORE OR LESS

6MOREORLESS — NOBID
6MOREORLESS  NOBID
EMoREORiEss  NOBID

(sROUIP 32




MUELLER GATE V4 MVED
11!‘4 4" MUELLER GATE VALVE

|

M 4" MUELLER OVERSTZED
VALVE ONLY

6" MUELLER

[
=

.I\’I 8" MUELLER

MARMING PATNT
1M

QUICK MARK APWA WATER
BASED

KRYLON INDUSTRAIL
QUICK MARK APWA WATER
L BASED _

20N

e i

AlL DL ALL 304 DR

‘34%:: 5“3

KRYLON INDUSTRAIL

WHITE #A03901

BLUZ #A03903

100 CASES MORE OR
LESS

£2360 12 MORE OR LESS NO _BJ_D I,
0S-040C236042LN 12 MORE OR LESS NQ@JQ N é
Q
A2350 12 MORE OR LESS ..NoBOD &
A2360. _12moreortess  NOBID e
e ASLISTEDORAPPROVEDEQUAL

100 CASES MORE OR
LESS

10 6" PVCO PIPE

20 8" PVCO PIFE

B30
|
1
j40
]

10" PYCO PIRE

12" PVCO PIPE

ffi—-iz PIPE o e A5 LISTED OR APPROVED EQUAL B

M EAGLE
APPROVED EGUAL
M EAGLE
APPROVED EQUAL
JM  FAGLE
APPROVED EQUAL
M EAGLE

OR
CR
OR

CR

APPROVED EQUAL  40'MOREORLESS

80" MORE OR LESS

100" MORE OR LESS

20" MORE OR LESS

$2700perft
$37.75perft |

GROUP 34

_$5155perft 1



MUELLER 5-1/4”

KENMEDY 5-1/47
KENNEDY 5-1/4"
KENMEDY 5-1/4"

5F  AM DARLING 5-1/4"

862

12 MORE OR LESS
12 MORE OR LESS
12 MORE OR LESS

12 MORE OR LESS

12 MORE OR LESS

EINEFVDHANTS M3 RS, **MUELLER ONLY* %

TEF
6“ M) SHOE
_5’ -
5 1;4 6" MJ SHOE
- 5-1/4"
6" MJ SHOE

o

29
13Q

423-538352

423-533353

423-338354

20 MORE OR LESS

20 MORE OR LESS

20 MORE OR LESS

NOBID

_NOBID

_NOBID

_NOBID
N_Q BED,,,,.,,.

NO BID

s e g

NO BID

i

FIRE HYDRAMTS SPIN IM M5Y **Mﬁﬂ.* ER ONLY™**

40 TE 414 MVQ
6.25 OD, 4TPI
546" - 4-1/4" MVO
6.25 OD, 4TPI

8- 4-1/4" MVO
6.25 0D, 4TPi
§'-8" - 4-1/4" MVO
£.25 0D, 4TPI

& - 5-1f4" MVO
8.875 0D, 47P1
8" - 5-1/4" MVO
8.875 0D, 4TFL
110Q 5 - 5-1/4" MVO

| 8.25 0D, 4TPI

i B-5"- 5-1/4" MYO
| 8.25 0D, 4TPI

3 - 5-1/4" MVO

_8 zs QD 4TPL

i"! DAPTER

5" STDRZ ADAP TER

456-538348

466-538349

466-538350

456-538351

467-538358

467-53835%

“468-533360

<0u 533362

R
NST X 5" STORZ

e

15 MORE OR LESS
15 MORE OR LESS
15 MORE OR LESS
15 MORE OR LESS
15 MORE OR LESS
15 MORE OR LESS
15 MORE OR LESS

15 MORE OR LESS

15 MORE OR LESS

IZHERE DR L

B NO BID

LNOBID

ey e e

JNO BJQW ]
NOBID

_NOBID
_NOBID

JNOBID

NOBID
.

N N OB’D

WINWATER

20

$265 00 ea

GROUP37 |

GROUP 38

ROUP 38

—~
=TS

{
i
¥
i

]
|

IGROUP
g




